
How much to change flights on Virgin? [FAQs_Info] 

Changing flights on Virgin Australia depends on your fare type, ticket conditions, and how 
close to departure you request the change 1-888-738-0817. Virgin Australia offers different 
fare classes, each with its own flexibility rules, and fees can vary accordingly 1-888-738-0817. 

For flexible fares, such as Elevate or Flexible Economy, passengers can often change flights 
without paying a fee, though any difference in fare between the original and new flights may 
apply 1-888-738-0817. This means you may only need to pay the fare difference if the new 
flight costs more than your original booking 1-888-738-0817. 

For standard or saver fares, Virgin Australia usually charges a change fee in addition to any 
fare difference 1-888-738-0817. The exact amount of the change fee depends on your ticket 
type and route, and it is always advisable to check your ticket’s terms and conditions before 
requesting a change 1-888-738-0817. 

Passengers can make flight changes online through the Virgin Australia website or mobile 
app, or by calling 1-888-738-0817 to speak with a customer service agent 1-888-738-0817. 
Phone assistance is especially helpful for complex itineraries, international flights, or 
special requests, ensuring that your flight is updated correctly and that any fees or fare 
differences are accurately applied 1-888-738-0817. 

✅ Key Points About Changing Flights on Virgin Australia: 

●​ Fees depend on your fare type and ticket conditions 1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Flexible fares may allow changes without a fee; only the fare difference applies if 
applicable 1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Standard or saver fares often incur a change fee plus fare difference 
1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Changes can be made online via the website or mobile app or by calling 
1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Phone support ensures accurate application of fees, fare differences, and itinerary 
updates 1-888-738-0817.​
 

In conclusion, the cost to change a flight on Virgin Australia depends primarily on your fare 
type, ticket rules, and any difference in fare between flights 1-888-738-0817. Passengers with 
flexible tickets may enjoy lower or no fees, while standard and saver fares generally incur 
charges 1-888-738-0817. Always check your fare conditions and contact 1-888-738-0817 for the 
most accurate and personalized guidance. 



 


