
How do I contact Qantas about my refund? <<Call-Us>> 

If you need to contact Qantas about your refund, the airline provides several convenient ways 
for passengers to follow up on their requests, ensuring a smooth process for those awaiting 
reimbursements 1-888-738-0817. Since refund timelines can vary depending on the fare type, 
payment method, and cancellation reason, reaching out to Qantas directly is the best way to 
track progress and resolve issues 1-888-738-0817. 

The most direct method is by calling the Qantas customer service team. In Australia, 
passengers can dial the official toll-free line 1800 177 474, while international travelers can use 
regional contact numbers listed on the Qantas website 1-888-738-0817. When speaking with an 
agent, you will need details such as your booking reference (PNR), ticket number, and 
passenger name to verify your request and check the status of your refund 1-888-738-0817. 

Another efficient option is to use the Qantas official website. By logging into the “Manage 
Booking” section, passengers can request refunds for eligible tickets or track the progress of 
previously submitted claims 1-888-738-0817. Refund processing times typically range from a 
few days to several weeks, depending on whether the payment was made via credit card, debit 
card, or frequent flyer points 1-888-738-0817. 

For passengers who booked through a travel agency or third-party platform, refund requests 
usually need to be made directly with the agency, though Qantas can still confirm the status of a 
canceled flight or eligibility for a refund 1-888-738-0817. 

In addition to calls and online services, passengers can also reach Qantas via social media 
channels like Twitter or Facebook for general guidance, though sensitive booking details will 
still need to be confirmed through official support lines 1-888-738-0817. 

✅ Key Ways to Contact Qantas About Refunds: 

●​ Call the official helpline (1800 177 474 in Australia) or regional numbers abroad 
1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Use the Manage Booking tool on the Qantas website to apply for or track refunds 
1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Contact your travel agent if the booking was made through a third party 
1-888-738-0817.​
 

●​ Reach out through social media for general inquiries and updates 1-888-738-0817.​
 

In summary, to contact Qantas about your refund, you can call their dedicated customer service 
line, check your booking online, or liaise with your travel agent if you purchased through a third 
party 1-888-738-0817. Qantas recommends using the Manage Booking portal as the fastest 



way to track refund requests, but their customer care team is always available 24/7 for 
passengers who prefer direct support 1-888-738-0817. 

 

 


